BUILDING PERMIT
AND

CONSTRUCTION HANDOUT
2009

New Construction / Renovations / Additions /
Alterations / Garages and Accessory Structures

CITY OF PARK HILLS, MISSOURI
DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
(573) 431-3577

SUBJECT TO REVISION WITHOUT NOTICE




CITY OF PARK HILLS
DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

GENERAL OFFICE INFORMATION

The office personnel of the Department of Community Development are available between the
of 8.00 am and 5:00 pm to provide information and answer questions concerning the following.

Building permit requirements and plan Submittals.

Code Enforcement activities.

Zoning issues and land-use regulation.

Floodplain management.

Dangerous building ordinance enforcement, condemnation.
City Cemetery plots.

Housing Code inspections, Certificates of Occupancy.

Open Burning Permits

CONTACTS

ZONING / PLAN REVIEW / COMMERCIAL INSPECTION / FLOODPLAIN MGMT
PERMITTING / CEMETERY

Department of Community Development
Telephone (573) 431-3577

RESIDENTIAL AND HOUSING INSPECTION / PLAN REVIEW
James Pope, Building Inspector (573) 431-3577, extension 34
NUISANCE ABATEMENT

David Dill, Code Enforcement Officer (573) 431-3577, extension 16

DEPARTMENTAL SCHEDULING

Lori A. Bolius, Administrative Assistant / Clerk (573) 431-3577, extension 19.
Office Facsimile: (573) 431-2598
Office E-Mail: citylhall@il .net

CONTRACTOR LICENSING

Paula Lee, City Collector (573) 431-3577, extension 10
DEPARTMENT MAILING ADDRESS

City Hall

9 Bennett Street
Park Hills, MO 63601



ADOPTED CODES
The following codes have been adopted by the City of Park Hills:

2006 International Building Code (IBC) 2006
International Plumbing Code (IPC) 2006 International
Mechanical Code (IMC) 2006 International Fire Code
(EEC)

2005 National Electric Code (INEC)

2006 International Residential Code (IRC)

Copies of the above listed codes are available for public inspection and use during normal busine
hours at City Hall. Individual pages or sections of a code may be photocopied for a fee of $.10

page.

Code Books may be purchased by visiting the website of the International Code Council (ICC) at
iccsafe.org.

LOCAL MODIFICATIONS TO THE ADOPTED CODES

The City of Park Hills has made amendments to the above referenced codes. The following
lists the, local amendments by section number.

The following sections of the 2006 International. Building Code are hereby revised as follows:

Section 101.1 - Insert: City of Park Hills. .
Section 101.4.1 - Change: ICC Electrical Code to 2005 National Electric Code
Section 101.4.5 - Delete.
Section 101.4.7 - Delete
Section 1612.3 Insert: City of Park Hills.
Section 1612.3 - Insert: Apnil 13, 2004
Section 1705 - Delete.
Section 1707 - Delete.
Section 1708 - Delete.
Section 3409.2 - Insert: May 1, 2006



The following sections of the 2006 International Plumbing Code are hereby revised:

Section 101.1 - Insert: City of Park Hills.
Section 106.6.2 - Insert: No Fee

Section 106.6.3 - Insert: 0 in two places.
Section 108.4 - Insert: Violations, § 500.00
Section 108.5 - Insert: $ 1.00, $ 500.00.
Section 305.6.1 - Insert: 24 inches, 24 inches.
Section 904.1 Insert: 12 inches.

The following sections of the 2006 International Mechanical Code are hereby revised

Section 101.1 - Insert: City of Park Hills.
Section 106.5.2 - Insert: No Fee

Section 106.5.3 - Insert: 0 in two places.
Section 108.4 - Insert: Violations, $ 500.00
Section 108.5 - Insert: $ 1.00, $ 500.00.

The following sections of the 2006 International Fire Prevention Code are hereby rex

Section 101.1- Insert: .City of Park Hills.
Section 108.4 -Insert: Violations, $:500.00
Section 108.5 - Insert: $ 1.00, § 500.00.

The following sections of the 2006 Interational Residential Code are hereby revised:

Section RI 011 — Insert: City of Park Hills.
Table R301.2(1) -Insert the following values:

Ground Snow Load : 20 psf.

Wind Speed: 90 mph

Seismic Design: Category C

Weathering: Severe

Frost Line Depth: 24 Inches

Termite: Slight to Moderate

Decay: Slight to Moderate

Winter Design Temp: 10 F

Flood Hazards: a) January 1, 1994 b) FIRM 2-18-98



PERMIT FEE SCHEDULE

BUILDING PERMIT FEES
The following fee schedule shall apply for all building permits:

Building Permits - New Construction -Primary Residential Structures
Single Family Dwelling - $.07 per square foot of gross floor area (excluding basement)
Two Family Dwelling - $.07 per square foot of gross floor area (excluding basement)

Building Permits - New Construction - Accessory Residential Structures
Detached Garages - $ 25.00

Other Accessory Structures - $ 15.00

Building Permits - New Construction - Multi-Family. Commercial and Industrial Structu’es Multi
Family Dwelling - $.07 per square foot of gross floor area

New Construction-10,000 square feet and under - $ .08 per square foot of gross area

New Constriction -Over 10,000 square feet - $ .085 per squate foot of gross area

Plan Review Fee - A base fee of $ 50.00 shall apply in all cases except when plans are submitted for buildings,
whose physical gross area exceeds the Base Tabular Area of table 503 of-the Building Code. Such
plans are subject to plan review by the City Engineer. The applicant shall be responsible to pay the
actual cost of plan review. Plan review fees shall not exceed $ 500.00 in any case.

Note: Building Permit fees for additions or substantial alteration of the above listed building types shall be
based on the applicable fee schedule for new construction..

OCCUPANCY INSPECTION FEES
The following fee schedule shall apply for all residential occupancy inspections:

Initial Inspection (I) and Follow-up Re-inspection (RI) - $ 30.00 Second
Re-nspection (R2) - $ 40.00

Third Re-inspection (R3) - $ 50.00

All inspections after the Third Re-inspection - $ 50.00 each



PLAN SUBMITTAL REQUIREMENTS

The City of Park Hills has in effect the 2006 International Family of Codes. These codes are
applicable to all property within the city limits. All residential property is subject to the provisions of
the 2006 International Residential Code (IRC) and all multi-family, commercial and industrial
property is subject to the provisions of the 2006 International Building Code (IBC). All construction
requires a permit. All applications for a permit shall be accompanied by adequate construction
documents to adequately illustrate the proposed construction. Permits shall not be approved unless the
minimum construction documents are provided as follows:

Type of Work

Plans required with application for permit.

New Residential
Dwellings or
Additions Thereto

1) Site Plan and Land Survey

2) Foundation Plan / Basement Floor Plan: Include pier spacing, pier
detail, basement beam (Type and Size), column spacing, joists size,
type and spacing.

3) Floor Plan for each floor of finished space including basements.
4) Typical Wall Section

5) Manufacturer's Truss Drawings

6) Door and Window Size Schedule (can be shown on floor plan)
Include Brand, series, model, sizes and placement.

7) Building Elevations
Detached Residential | 1) Site Plan (A land survey may be required)
Garages 2) Foundation Plan
3) Floor Plan
4) Typical Wall Section
5) Manufacturer's Truss Drawings
Residential Accessory | 1) Site Plan
Building over 100 S.F. |2) Framing Details.
Type of Work Plans required with application for permit

Commercial Projects
Multi-Family Projects

Full sealed plans are required for the construction. Plan sets shall
have a minimum of floor plans, foundation plans, wall sections,

Industrial Projects building elevations, door and window schedules, framing details,
means of egress components and fire-resistive materials details.
All plans shall bear the seal of a state registered design professional.
Interior Renovation Varies depending upon scope of work. Consult the Code Official.







